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Kepada: ifan_fanox@yahoo.co.id
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----- Pesan yang Diteruskan -----

Dari: "Tudor Papuc" <ptudor2008@yahoo.com>

Kepada: "Nebuchad Nezzar" <nezzarnebuchad@yahoo.co.id>
Cc:

Terkirim: Sel, 26 Nov 2019 pada 17:30

Judul: Re: Bls: Re: Bls: Re: Publication Payment

Congratulations! Your paper has been published.

You can find it here: http://www.bioflux.com.ro/docs/2019.2015-2019.ndf or in the
attachment.

Thank you kindly for your hard work, cooperation and patience.

Best Regards,
Tudor Papuc
Editor, Bioflux SRL

On Tuesday, November 26, 2019, 09:59:48 AM GMT+2, Tudor Papuc <ptudor2008@yahoo.com> wrote:

this is perfect, thank you,

Best Regards,
Tudor Papuc
Editor, Bioflux SRL

On Tuesday, November 26, 2019, 09:57:44 AM GMT+2, Nebuchad Nezzar <nezzarnebuchad@yahoo.co.id> wrote:

Dear Dr. Tudor Papuc

The method :

During biogas production, parameters

observed are the pH and volume of the gas

done every day.

gas composition analysis using chroma

gas toography. Current gas chromatography conditions

the process is the temperature of the carrier gas and the detector
which is 2000C, while the column temperature is 1500C.

The flow rate in the column is 43 mL / min.

Data on the composition of the gas produced
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of GC expressed in percent.
The data is used to calculate
the volume of methane gas produced
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Pada Sel, 26 Nov 2019 pada 15:07, Tudor Papuc
<ptudor2008@yahoo.com> menulis:

Thank you,

Please tell me the method by which you determined the gas composition (methane,
nitrogen...) here, in a message, so I can write it in the text.

Best Regards,

Tudor Papuc
Editor, Bioflux SRL

On Tuesday, November 26, 2019, 06:04:00 AM GMT+2, Nebuchad Nezzar <nezzarnebuchad@yahoo.co.id>
wrote:

Dear
Dr. Tutor Papuc

We attached manuscrip correction.
We hope can to publish in Bioflux Journal.

Best Regards
Nebuchadnezzar Akbar

Pada Selasa, 26 November 2019 05.33.01 WITA, Tudor Papuc <ptudor2008@yahoo.com> menulis:

There are more corrections that need to be made.
Read the comments and make the corrections. After this, maybe we can publish it.
Also, please agree with this form of the manuscript for publication.

Please take more care when doing the corrections, because last time you made it
WOTSe...

Also, please be more careful when citing other works... a lot of references are not
cited in the text.

Best Regards,
Tudor Papuc
Editor, Bioflux SRL

On Monday, November 18, 2019, 09:03:16 AM GMT+2, Tudor Papuc <ptudor2008@yahoo.com> wrote:

[ have received the document and I am working on it.
Thank you,
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Best Regards,
Tudor Papuc
Editor, Bioflux SRL

On Monday, November 18, 2019, 08:33:54 AM GMT+2, Nebuchad Nezzar <nezzarnebuchad@yahoo.co.id>
wrote:

Dear
Dr. Tutor Papuc

We attached manuscrip correction.
We hope can to publish in Bioflux Journal.

Best Regards
Nebuchadnezzar Akbar
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Pada Jum, 15 Nov 2019 pada 2:13, Tudor Papuc
<ptudor2008@yahoo.com> menulis:

Hello,

Please find attached the paper with the reviewer comments.

There is also a model of paper attached, because you need to format the paper,
the citations and references, and write the authors full names, affiliations and
email addresses.

Also, please try to correct the English, because it is very bad.

After you make the corrections, please send the manuscript back to me.
Best Regards,

Tudor Péapuc
Editor, Bioflux SRL

On Wednesday, October 9, 2019, 08:46:56 AM GMT+3, Tudor Papuc <ptudor2008@yahoo.com> wrote:

Hello,

Thank you for the payment. Yes, the swift key and the info were the ones you
mentioned, as stated in the payment details email.

The bank transfer usually takes a few days, but as soon as it is confirmed (it will
be, no problem here), I am sending you the reviews.

Best Regards,

Tudor Papuc

Editor, Bioflux SRL

On Wednesday, October 9, 2019, 06:56:48 AM GMT+3, Nebuchad Nezzar <nezzarnebuchad@yahoo.co.id>

wrote:
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Dear
Dr. Tudor Papuc

we enclose proof of payment of the journal with the title " Seaweed Sargassum Sp. As the
Material of Biogas Production", authored by Muhammad Irfan, lis Hamsir Wahab,
Sarni, Riyadi Subur, Nebuchadnezzar Akbar.

Thank you for your cooperation

Best Regards
Nebuchadnezzar Akbar
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